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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aBer the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date :2012-10-01 Pages: 181 Publisher: the Basic information
Tsinghua University Press book edge kc11.21 Title: Liberal Arts in the University 11th Five-Year the computer
planning materials: computer application tutorials ( 7 edition) (Windows 7 and OEice 2007 environment)
Problem Solving with hands-on exercises original price: 20.00 yuan of: amusement language autumn Publisher:
Tsinghua University Press Publication Date: October 1. 2012 ISBN: 9787302300250 Words: Page: 181 Revision: 1
Binding: Paperback: Weight: 340 g Editor's Choice colleges and universities and liberal arts majors Eleventh
Five-Year computer planning materials: computer application tutorials (7th Edition) (Windows 7 and Office 2007
environment ) Answers to of some chapters of the main textbook exercises and hands-on exercises.
supplements. especially to increase the application of strong-on exercises. Colleges and universities and liberal
arts majors Eleventh Five-Year computer planning materials: computer application tutorials (7) (Windows 7 and
OEice 2007 environment) Problem Solving assisted with the book-on practice can be used as the main
materials. The readers can be used alone as a self-study using books to learn computer knowledge and
application. also available to participate in the National Computer Rank Examination. The executive summary
colleges liberal arts majors Eleventh Five-Year computer planning materials: computer application tutorials (7)
(Windows 7 and OEice 2007 environment) Problem Solving with hands-on exercises is supporting the main
textbook Book answer exercises and exercises and hands-on exercises. including the main textbook operation
guidance. The book is divided into 11 chapters. corresponding to the first 11 chapters of the main textbook.
basic computer knowledge. Chinese operating system Windows 7 in English keyboard input method. word
processing soBware Word 2007. the spreadsheet soBware Excel 2007. multimedia application base and PDF
format file. image...
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